Bid No. 2016-02 BID TABULATION BID Opening: March 29, 2016

Road Materials At 2:00 p.m.
CITY OF ALLENTOWN
PURCHASING OFFICE
Coopersburg Materials, Div. Of Naceville Materials, JV ABE Materials- Easton Division of H& K Group, Inc Asphalt Maintenance Solutions. LLC Hei-Way, LLC
ATTN: H. Chris Budenz ATTN: John Kibblehouse P ATTN: Terry Crouthamel ’ ATTN: Kean Pitcarin
483 Springfield Street, Coopersburg, PA 18036 5137 Lower Mud Run Rd, Easton, PA 18040 P o gox 387 290 North Pike Road
Corporate: 350 S. Main Street, Suite 207 Corporate: P.O. Box 196, Skippack, PA 19474 Center l\/a.llle PA 18034 Sarver, PA 16055
Doylestown, PA 18901 Telephone: 610-222-3622 Telephone: 6)1,0—797—2645 Telephone: 724-353-2700
Telephone: 610-222-3622 Fax: 610-584-1529 P o Fax: 724-353-2888
. Fax: 610-797-4654 . .
Fax: 610-584-1523 Email: bschatz@hkgroup.com . Email: kean@hei-way.com
. . Email: tcrouthamel@amsroads.com -
Email: bschatz@hkgroup.com 10% Bid Bond 10% Bid Bond 10% Bid Bond
10% Bid Bond °
GROUP 1 - CRUSHED AGGREGATES - CITY TO PICK UP AT VENDOR'S PLANT
NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
1 |AASHTO #1 50 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 9.75 487.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 |1/4" WASHED STONE 200 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 |3/8" WASHED STONE 300 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 13.00 3,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 |AASHTO #57 100 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 10.38 1,038.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 [2A STONE 1,000 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 7.48 7,480.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 [2 RC STONE 150 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 6.90 1,035.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 |3A CLEAN STONE 250 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 10.48 2,620.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 |R4 STONE 60 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 10.00 600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 |GABION STONE 100 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 13.50 1,350.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 |ANTI SKID AS3 SIMILAR to AASHTO #8 500 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 13.00 6,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 |SHOT ROCK 250 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 9.00 2,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 |#10 SCREENING 300 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 10.58 3,174.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 |YELLOW MASON SAND 100 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 33.00 3,300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ADD $__ /TON FOR VENDOR TO DELIVER AGGREGATES TO ANY LOCATION IN NO BID 10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
THE CITY
TOTAL GROUP 1
CRUSHED AGGREGATES NO BID 33,734.50 NO BID NO BID
GROUP 1 - CRUSHED AGGREGATES - CITY TO PICK UP AT VENDOR'S PLANT -
ALTERNATES
NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
14 zgg;c;rgz%am CONSIDERED IN LIEU OF ITEM NO. 10 250 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 18.00 4,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP 2 - ASPHALT - CITY TO PICK UP
NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
15 [PG 64-22 (AC-20) 450 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID Easton 4.50 2,025.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 |E-3 EMULSION 300 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2937 S. Pike Street $ 390 | $ 1,170.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Allentown, PA 18103
2938 S. Pike Street
17 |ASTM D-6690 Type | RUBBERIZED CRACK SEAL 75,000 LBS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 047 | $ 35,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Allentown, PA 18103
18 |CSS1H 2,500 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2939 S. Pike Street $ 415 | $ 10,375.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Allentown, PA 18103
H&K Materials- 2940 S. Pike Street
19 [AE_T 2,500 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID Chalfont 3.00 7,500.00 Allentown, PA 18103 $ 365 | $ 9,125.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID




Bid No. 2016-02 BID TABULATION BID Opening: March 29, 2016
Road Materials At 2:00 p.m.
CITY OF ALLENTOWN
PURCHASING OFFICE

Coopersburg Materials, Div. Of Naceville Materials, JV ABE Materials- Easton Division of H& K Group, Inc Asphalt Maintenance Solutions. LLC Hei-Way, LLC
ATTN: H. Chris Budenz ATTN: John Kibblehouse P ATTN: Terry Crouthamel ’ ATTN: Kean Pitcarin
483 Springfield Street, Coopersburg, PA 18036 5137 Lower Mud Run Rd, Easton, PA 18040 P o gox 387 290 North Pike Road
Corporate: 350 S. Main Street, Suite 207 Corporate: P.O. Box 196, Skippack, PA 19474 Center .VE.I||€ PA 18034 Sarver, PA 16055
Doylestown, PA 18901 Telephone: 610-222-3622 Telephone: 6)1,0—797—2645 Telephone: 724-353-2700
Telephone: 610-222-3622 Fax: 610-584-1529 P T Fax: 724-353-2888
. Fax: 610-797-4654 . ;
Fax: 610-584-1523 Email: bschatz@hkgroup.com . Email: kean@hei-way.com
. . Email: tcrouthamel@amsroads.com -
Email: bschatz@hkgroup.com 10% Bid Bond 10% Bid Bond

o0 R
10% Bid Bond 10% Bid Bond

NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

Polymer Modified Masterseal (PPM) Bituminous road
treatment shall include 2 Ibs per gallon of silica sand
included within the mixture to insure proper ratios, no post
blending of sand allowed.

20 1,500 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CONTRACTOR DELIVERED - ASPHALT CONTRACTOR TO FURNISH AND
DELIVER TO ANY POINT IN THE CITY

21 |AE_T 2,500 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 475 | $ 11,875.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 |CSS1H 2,500 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 525 | $ 13,125.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 |E-3 EMULSION (MINIMUM 500GALLLON PER ORDER) 8,000 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 415 | $ 33,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 |ASTM D-6690 Type | RUBBERIZED CRACK SEAL 75,000 | LBS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 047 | $ 35,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Polymer Modified Masterseal (PPM) Bituminous road
treatment shall include 2 Ibs per gallon of silica sand

25 |. o ) . - 1500 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
included within the mixture to insure proper ratios, no post
blending of sand allowed.
TOTAL GROUP 2
ASPHALT NO BID $ 9,525.00 $ 149,370.00 NO BID
GROUP 3 - PREMIXES
NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 9.5MM PG
26 |64-22 WEARING COURSE 0 TO 0.3 MILLION ESAL'S (SRL 200 TON |Coopersburg $ 4510 | $ 9,020.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
H) 1-1/2" DEPTH

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 9.5 MM PG
27 (64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 MILLION ESAL'S 8,000 TON |Coopersburg $ 42.95 | $ 343,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(SRL H) 1-1/2" DEPTH
SUPERPAVE DESIGN 12.5 MM PG
28 (64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 MILLION ESAL'S 200 TON |Coopersburg $ 4495 | $ 8,990.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(SRL H) 1 1/2"-2" DEPTH
SUPERPAVE DESIGN 19 MM PG
29 (64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 MILLION ESAL'S 400 TON |Coopersburg $ 41.25|$ 16,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(SRL H) 2 1/2"-3" DEPTH
SUPERPAVE DESIGN 19 MM PG
30 (64-22 BINDER COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 MILLION ESAL'S (SRL | 3,000 TON [Coopersburg $ 41.25 | $ 123,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
H) 2 1/2"-3" DEPTH
SUPERPAVE DESIGN 25MM PG

31 (64-22 BINDER COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 MILLION ESAL'S 3"-5" 3,000 TON |Coopersburg $ 39.15 | $ 117,450.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DEPTH
32 SUPERPAVE DESIGN 25MM PG 7,000 TON [Coopersburg $ 36.50 | $ 255,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

64-22 3-30 ESAL'sBCBC 3"-5" DEPTH

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 9.5 MM PG
33 [64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 MILLION ESAL'S 2,000 TON |Coopersburg $ 4295 | $ 85,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(SRL M) 1-1/2" DEPTH

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 12.5 MM PG
34 (64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 MILLION ESAL'S 100 TON [Coopersburg $ 44.95 | $ 4,495.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(SRL M) 1 1/2"-2" DEPTH

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 19 MM PG
35 |64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 MILLION ESAL'S 250 TON |Coopersburg $ 4125 | $ 10,312.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
(SRL M) 2 1/2"-3" DEPTH

36 |ID-2 (Marshall Mix) 500 TON |Coopersburg $ 4295 | $ 21,475.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Bid No. 2016-02
Road Materials

BID TABULATION

BID Opening: March 29, 2016

At 2:00 p.m.
CITY OF ALLENTOWN
PURCHASING OFFICE
Coopersburg Materials, Div. Of Naceville Materials, JV ABE Materials- Easton Division of H& K Group, Inc Asphalt Maintenance Solutions. LLC Hei-Way, LLC
ATTN: H. Chris Budenz ATTN: John Kibblehouse P ATTN: Terry Crouthamel ’ ATTN: Kean Pitcarin
483 Springfield Street, Coopersburg, PA 18036 5137 Lower Mud Run Rd, Easton, PA 18040 P o gox 387 290 North Pike Road
Corporate: 350 S. Main Street, Suite 207 Corporate: P.O. Box 196, Skippack, PA 19474 Center .VE.I||€ PA 18034 Sarver, PA 16055
Doylestown, PA 18901 Telephone: 610-222-3622 Telephone: 6)1,0—797—2645 Telephone: 724-353-2700
Telephone: 610-222-3622 Fax: 610-584-1529 P T Fax: 724-353-2888
. Fax: 610-797-4654 . ;
Fax: 610-584-1523 Email: bschatz@hkgroup.com Email: tcrouthamel@amsroads.com Email: kean@hei-way.com
Email: bschatz@hkgroup.com 10% Bid Bond ’ 10% Bid Bond ’ 10% Bid Bond
10% Bid Bond °
NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
SUPERPAVE DESIGN 4.75MM PG
37 |64-22 WEARING COURSE .3 TO 3.0 MILLION ESAL'S (SRL 150 TON |Coopersburg $ 63.00 9,450.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
M) 1/2" to 3/4" DEPTH
38 |QPR 2000 HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD PATCH 50 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID :Z:;/V:raslgA $ 8453 | $ 4,226.50
ADD $__ /TON FOR VENDOR TO DELIVER AGGREGATES TO ANY LOCATION IN $ 5.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 32.00 N/A
THE CITY
TOTAL GROUP 3
PREMIXES 1,006,442.50 NO BID NO BID $ 4,226.50
GROUP 3 - PREMIXES - CITY TO PICK UP AT VENDOR'S
PLANT - ALTERNATES
NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
UPM HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD PATCH (BEING .
39 CONSIDERED IN LIEU OF ITEM NO. 31 QPR 2000) 50 TON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hei-Way* $ 109.00 | $ 5,450.00
GROUP 4 - GEOTEXTILES
NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
40 [INON-WOVEN OL PAVING GEOTEXTILE 10' X 360" 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 INON-WOVEN OL PAVING GEOTEXTILE 12' 6" X 360" 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HEAVY WEIGHT GEOTEXTILE FOR GROUND
42 |STABILIZATION AND EROSION CONTROL 12' 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6" X 360)
43 |DELIVERY CHARGE TO CITY FACILITY 1 LT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL GROUP 4
GEOTEXTILES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

* Pick-up at Hei-Way, LLC, stocking location at: 2950 State Road,
Bensalem, PA 19020, Pricing is for Hei-Way Premium, PennDot
approved cold patch asphalt PADOT "special bituminous patching,

mat." Delivery minimum 22-24 tons quality.



